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19/05/2025, 18:24 Gmail - Fwd: CREDIT ADVICE

Pradeep Kumar Pradhan {pradeep}vnrg@gmail.cam?
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Fwd: CREDIT ADVICE

1 message
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Jana Vikas Organisation <jvorissa.org@gmail.com= Mon, May 19, 2025 at 12:43 PM
To: P K <pradeepjvorg@gmail.com=
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———------ Forwarded message ------—--

From: fxremit.00691 <fxremit.00691@sbi.co.in>

Date: Sat, May 17, 2025 at 3:26 PM

Subject: CREDIT ADVICE

To: jvorissa.org@gmail.com <jvorissa.org@gmail.com>

New Delhi Main Branch,

Bank of India

Foreign Exchange Division,

11, Parliament Street,
New Delhi- 110001.

Branch Code (00691)

E-mail: fxremit.00691@sbi.co.in

Certificate of Foreign Inward Remittance

Date:17.05.2025

To,
40099933160

JANA VIKAS

We hereby confirm that we have credited your Account 40099933160 towards inward remittance received as per
details as under:

Our Reference Number 2025051600691A392
Date of Credit 16-05-2025

Currency UsSD

Foreign Currency Amount 4100

Rate 84.849999999999994

O WO - QO (¢ mmrm:.;u..mmik:d?n?adeOB&uiew=Dt&search=ali&permth%d=thread+f:1832532215541T4U148&5impl=msg-f:1832532215541... 1/2



19/05/2025, 18:24 Gmail - Fwd: CREDIT ADVICE

INR Amount 347885

Beneficiary A/c No. 40099933160

Beneficiary Name JANA VIKAS

Remitter Name 1/FUNDACJA CHRISTIANI

Address of Remitter 2/UL. LUDWIKA NARBUTTA,21
3/IPLIWARSZAWA, 02-536 MAZOWIECKIE, WA
3/IRSZAWA

Country of Remitter PL

This is a computer generated letter and does not require signature.

In case of any discrepancy, please write us on fxremit.00691@sbi.co.in with subject of e-mail ‘Discrepancy in FIRC’
within 07 days.

The information in this mail is confidential and is intended solely for addressee. Access to this mail by anyone else Is
unauthorized. Copying or further distribution beyond the original recipient may be unlawful. Any opinion expressed in
this mail is that of sender and does not necessarily reflect that of State Bank group.
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%% State Bank of India 10K
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JANA VIKAS

K. NUAGAON - 762 102
Kandhamal Dist-.Orissa

Date /0 /0& Zé’égg FC A/C.
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MONEY RECEIPT




17/06/2025, 10:06

Fwd: CREDIT ADVICE

1 message

Gmail - Fwd: CREDIT ADVICE

Pradeep Kumar Pradhan <pradeepjvorg@gmail.com>

Jana Vikas Organisation <jvorissa.org@gmail.com>

To: P K <pradeepjvorg@gmail.com>

-----——--- Forwarded message ---------

From: fxremit.00691 <fxremit.00691@sbi.co.in>

Date: Wed, Jun 11, 2025, 3:45 PM
Subject: CREDIT ADVICE

To: jvorissa.org@gmail.com <jvorissa.org@gmail.com>

Thu, Jun 12, 2025 at 10:12 AM

..

k of

’ $tate Ban

India

New Delhi Main Branch,
Foreign Exchange Division,
11, Parliament Street,

New Delhi- 110001.

Branch Code (00691)

E-mail: ixremit.00691@sbi.co.in

To,
40099933160
JANA VIKAS

Certificate of Foreign Inward Remittance

Date: 11.06.2025

We hereby confirm that we have credited your Account 40099933160 towards inward remittance received as per

details as under:

Our Reference Number 2025061000691A259
Date of Credit 10-06-2025

Currency EUR

Foreign Currency Amount 4985

Rate 95.989999999999995

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d7e2ad3403&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 1834696928 785082583 &simpl=msg-f:1834696928785. .. 1/2



17/06/2025, 10:06 Gmail - Fwd: CREDIT ADVICE

INR Amount 478510.15000000002

Beneficiary A/c No. 40099933160

Beneficiary Name JANA VIKAS

Remitter Name 1/JOY FOR KIDS VZW

Address of Remitter 2ITORTELDUIFSTRAAT 3/BE/9000 GENT
Country of Remitter BE

This is a computer generated letter and does not require signature.

In case of any discrepancy, please write us on fxremit.00691@sbi.co.in with subject of e-mail ‘Discrepancy in FIRC’
within 07 days.

The information in this mail is confidential and is intended solely for addressee. Access to this mail by anyone else Is
unauthorized. Copying or further distribution beyond the original recipient may be unlawful. Any opinion expressed In
this mail is that of sender and does not necessarily reflect that of State Bank group.

2 attachments
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JANA VIKAS

K. NUAGAON - 762 102
Kandhamal Dist-.Orissa

Date //06 | §03% 'FC A/C. ‘ Sl. No..4 98
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MONEY RECEIPT,




17/06/2025, 10:05 Gmail - Fwd: CREDIT ADVICE

*@% G rﬁ%ﬁ Pradeep Kumar Pradhan <pradeepjvorg@gmail.com>
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Fwd CREDIT ADVICE

1 message

Jana Vikas Organisation <jvorissa.org@gmail.com> Mon, Jun 16, 2025 at 7:10 PM
To: P K <pradeepjvorg@gmail.com>

- —---———-- Forwarded message ---------
From: fxremit.00691 <fxremit.00691@sbi.co.in>
Date: Mon, Jun 16, 2025, 5:15 PM
Subject: CREDIT ADVICE
To: jvorissa.org@gmail.com <jvorissa.org@gmail.com>

New Delhi Main Branch,

Foreign Exchange Division,

11, Parliament Street,

New Delhi- 110001.

Branch Code (00691)

E-mail: fxremit.00691@sbi.co.in

Certificate of Foreign Inward Remittance

Date: 16.06.2025

To,
40099933160
JANA VIKAS

We hereby confirm that we have credited your Account 40099933160 towards inward remittance received as per
details as under:

Our Reference Number 2025061300691A125
Date of Credit 13-06-2025

Currency EUR

Foreign Currency Amount 625

Rate 97.719999999999999

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d7e2ad3403&view=pi&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1835093257207004070&simpl=msg-f: 1835093257207 . .. 1/2



17/06/2025, 10:05 Gmail - Fwd: CREDIT ADVICE

INR Amount 61075

Beneficiary A/c No. 40099933160

Beneficiary Name JANA VIKAS

Remitter Name 1/JOY FOR KIDS VZW

Address of Remitter 2/ TORTELDUIFSTRAAT 3/BE/9000 GENT
Country of Remitter DE

This is a computer generated letter and does not require signature.

In case of any discrepancy, please write us on xremit.00691@sbi.co.in with subject of e-mail ‘Discrepancy in FIRC’
within 07 days.

The information in this mail is confidential and is intended solely for addressee. Access to this mail by anyone else is
unauthorized. Copying or further distribution beyond the original recipient may be unlawful. Any opinion expressed in
this mail is that of sender and does not necessarily reflect that of State Bank group.
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